

Student Chromebook Bid - May 6, 2019

Vendor	Model	Unit Price	Google Chrome Mgmt License	Shipping for 2000	Asset tagging	Total with shipping for 2000	Notes
RTI	HP Chromebook 11 G7 EE	\$ 195.00	\$ 23.95	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 445,900.00	6QY25UT#ABA
RTI	HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE	\$ 184.00	\$ 23.95	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 423,900.00	6KJ20UT#ABA
LOGISTA	HP Chromebook 11 G7 EE	\$ 178.60	\$ 23.25	\$ -	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 412,200.00	6QY25UT#ABA
LOGISTA	HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE	\$ 169.20	\$ 23.25	\$ -	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 393,400.00	6KJ20UT#ABA
SDF	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 195.00	\$ 27.90	\$ -	\$ 26,660.00	\$ 462,460.00	81QB0000US
FIREFLY COMPUTERS	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 209.00	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 466,000.00	81QB0000US
CDW	HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE	\$ 173.00	\$ 23.83	\$ -	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 400,660.00	6KJ20UT#ABA
TRINITY 3 TECHNOLOGY	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 321.00	\$ 23.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 688,000.00	81QB0000US, White Glove +4 YR ADP
TRINITY 3 TECHNOLOGY	HP Chromebook 11 G7 EE	\$ 399.00	\$ 23.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 844,000.00	6QY25UT#ABA, White Glove +4 YR ADP
TRINITY 3 TECHNOLOGY	HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE	\$ 339.00	\$ 23.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 724,000.00	6KJ20UT#ABA
TRINITY 3 TECHNOLOGY	Dell 3100 N4000	\$ 360.00	\$ 23.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 766,000.00	
TRINITY 3 TECHNOLOGY	Lenovo 100e Gen2 N4000	\$ 344.00	\$ 23.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 734,000.00	
AREY JONES	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 173.56	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 395,580.00	81QB0000US
AREY JONES	HP Chromebook 11 G7 EE	\$ 183.89	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 416,240.00	6QY25UT#ABA
AREY JONES	HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE	\$ 174.20	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 396,860.00	6KJ20UT#ABA
AREY JONES	Acer Chromebook 311 C721 25A5-A4	\$ 205.29	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 459,040.00	NX.HBNA.001
AREY JONES	Acer Chromebook 311 C733-C37P	\$ 232.25	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 512,960.00	NX.H8VAA.002
AREY JONES	Dell Chromebook 3100	\$ 244.52	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 537,500.00	T06KM
AREY JONES	Lenovo 100e Gen2 N4000	\$ 182.82	\$ 23.23	\$ -	\$ 2,000.00	\$ 414,100.00	81MA0000US
HOWARD	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 220.00	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 496,000.00	\$31 3yr depot repair \$37 ADP, \$5 White Glove
HOWARD	Lenovo 100e Gen2 N4000	\$ 260.00	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 576,000.00	\$31 3yr depot repair \$37 ADP, \$5 White Glove
HOWARD	HP Chromebook 11A G6 EE	\$ 188.00	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 432,000.00	\$108 3 yr Warranty with ADP next day \$70 3 yr Depot, \$5 White Glove
HOWARD	HP Chromebook 11 G7 EE	\$ 198.00	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ 8,000.00	\$ 452,000.00	\$108 3 yr Warranty with ADP next day \$70 3 yr Depot, \$5 White Glove
BEST BUY	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 198.59	\$ 22.75	\$ -	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 449,180.00	81QB0000US
PCMG	Lenovo 100e Gen2 MTK	\$ 218.97	\$ 24.00	\$ -	\$ 22,000.00	\$ 507,940.00	81QB0000US

Bid opening Conducted by

Budi Mish 5-6-19

Brandi Wisenbaker
Finance Coordinator

Al Powell 5-6-19

Al Powell
Technology Director

Sheila A Badley 5-6-19

Sheila Badley
Technology Technician

Earthwalk SS32 Carts	Unit Price 4	Delivery	Unit Price (4)		Unit Price (6)		Unit Price (5)		Unit Price (6)		TOTAL	Notes
Vendor	MBE	MBE	PMLC	Delivery PMLC	DES	Delivery DES	HES	Delivery HES	WES	Delivery WES		
RTI (Riverside Tech Inc)											\$ -	NO BID
LOGISTA											\$ -	NO BID
SDF											\$ -	NO BID
FIREFLY COMPUTERS											\$ -	NO BID
CDW											\$ -	NO BID
TRINITY 3 TECHNOLOGY											\$ -	NO BID
AREY JONES	\$ 1,543.97	\$ -	\$ 1,543.97	\$ -	\$ 1,543.97	\$ -	\$ 1,543.97	\$ -	\$ 1,543.97	\$ -	\$ 38,599.25	
EARTHWALK	\$ 1,289.00	\$ -	\$ 1,289.00	\$ -	\$ 1,289.00	\$ -	\$ 1,289.00	\$ -	\$ 1,289.00	\$ -	\$ 32,225.00	
HOWARD	\$ 1,420.00	\$ 396.00	\$ 1,420.00	\$ 396.00	\$ 1,420.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 1,420.00	\$ 495.00	\$ 1,420.00	\$ 594.00	\$ 37,975.00	
BEST BUY											\$ -	NO BID
PCMG											\$ -	NO BID

Bid opening Conducted by

Brandi Wisenbaker 5-6-19

Brandi Wisenbaker
Finance Coordinator

Al Rowell 5-6-19

Al Rowell
Technology Director

Sheila Badley 5-6-19

Sheila Badley
Technology Technician